
From: 1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 20, 2019 11:07 PM 
To: Kathy Ruemmler 
Subject: Re: 

understood the game begins. = perfect timing for us as we will now let them stew 

On Thu, Mar 21, 201= at 12:05 AM Kathy Ruemmler « > wrote:mailtc 

I screwed up: not 7500 shares. It is $7.5 mm of shares= so effectively 6100 shares at current price. 
=br>On Mar 20, 2019, at 3:57 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.=om> wrote: 

i think you shoul= tell maggie that quinn emanual will pay 10 per year, plus a sgning=bonus, . so we have an 
issue 

please note<=r> 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential,=may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, a=d is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of<=r>JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication =r any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you h=ve received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately b= 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communica=ion and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all r=ghts reserved 
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