
From: 3BIS Jeremie LECLERE < 
Sent: Tuesday, March 19, 2019 5:01 PM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Cc: 3BIS Fabrice BOURG; HIS Nicolas PAPAMILTIADES; 
Subject: RE: 3BIS - GSJ Project Invoice 02 

Dear Sir, 

</=> 

We acknowle=ge receipt of your payment and we thank you for it. 

=/o:p> 

Could you p=ease confirm your coming to Paris this week, and if you wish to meet in ou= offices at the end of the week? 

=/o:p> 

Thank you i= advance. 

=/o:p> 

Best regard= 

<http://www.3bis.archi/> 

From: J <jeev=cation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
Sent: Friday, March 15, 2019 12:48:25 AM 
To: 3BIS Fabrice BOURG; 
Subject: 

ive agreed your proposal and will send 1st installme=t tomorw. I hope to be in paris next week. &n=sp; comments re 
plan, colonade - not sure how it m=ets roofs of builidings as they are all of a different height. =. can we get planters 
that just can be put in on the ground. or do we need to build.? = . not sure of temp design for middle pathways . 

future house. prefer pool out side maste=. . , your design has it too close to cottage. I t=ink . miami mep team will 
be sent . . =ontractor that built library , no longer here. . will send pla=s. 
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please no=e 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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