
From: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Saturday, August 19, 2017 9:12 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Admiral Farragut Academy: LS1 Credit Cards 

Thank you 

Ann R. 

On Aug 19, 2017, at 4:26 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

no, i pay for everything flights clothes ALL . / thats our agreement . I hope it works 

On Sat Au: 19 2017 at 3:43 PM, Ann Rodriquez 
wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

I'm sorry, that I'm always so sorry. I had to use my LSJ credit cards to deal with the School financial 
dept., Uniforms, furnishing of the Room & School supplies requested by the school. 

If I could've afford it, I would not have used the L.S1 credit cards. I was in a tight spot financially before I 
left with the girls but I will pay back everything once I catch my self 

Please understand and I'm sorry, 
Anna 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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