From: I N -

Sent: Wednesday, August 16, 2017 6:51 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

He is out of office this week. They ga=e me a number for Dr. Minutoli who is apparently covering for him.. Have you
heard of him?&nb=p;

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 16, 2017, at 2:39=PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmas=l.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

yes

sh=uld | call Woody for that?
Sent from my iPhone
O= Aug 16, 2017, at 2:33 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gma=l.com> >

wrote:

=blockquote type="cite">
can t hurt

on Wed, Aug 16, 2017 at -2 o, [N I <

Having ear pain and clogged feeling and migraine agai=.. | wonder if an ear infection could be causing all
this and antibiotics w=uld help. Think | should try?

Sent from my iPhone

please note

The infor=ation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-c=ient privileged, may
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constitute inside information, and is intended only=for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof i= strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

c=mmunication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or b= e-mail to jeeva=ation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
destroy this communication and all copies there=f,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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