
From: David Mitchell 
Sent: Monday, January 22, 2018 7:45 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

Says that Howie is trying to raise his port=on 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdin•s LLC =/div> 

On Jan 22, 2=18, at 2:32 PM, jeffrey E. <jee=acation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

???what happened? 

On Mon, Jan 22, 2018 at 4:23 PM, David Mitchell <=pan dir="Itr' 
wrote: 

FYI; 

sent this to Hanson thi= morning, he will need to fund soon 

Payments made as of date of Crescendo term s=eet: 

$ 5,000.00 - Check #1499 to Sadkin (L=gal retainage per term sheet) 
$ 1,177.70 - ATM Ending 8006 on 01.17.18 to C=nEd 
$=0,000.00 - Wire on 01.22.18 to Life Hotel Operations 
$ 6,400.00 =- Wire on 01.18.18 to Life Hotel Operations (net) 

$52,577.70 

WM Reimbursable as of 12/31/17= 
$1,1=2,522.11 
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 <fr.> 
DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 

= please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitu=e inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee.=lt is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of t=is 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may b= unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please noti=y us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeev=cation@gmail.com> , and 
destr=y this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. c=pyright -all rights reserved 
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