
From: Barry J. Cohen < 
Sent: Wednesday, August 9, 2017 2:05 PM 
To: Jeffrey E.' 
Subject: RE: [External] 

I think SAC paid him 300-ish. He is an upgrade on the tax side, but the other Joe is not tax. He is accounting, and we 
think he does an excellent job. 

E&Y is looking over Tom's shoulder on tax compliance and doing fine. On tax planning, they have contributed one or 
two tidbits, but have otherwise been very slow and disappointing. We are going to politely tell them that and hope that 
they will be better in the future. We have upcoming meetings with them to discuss the plane and Phaidon. 

We talked to them about your fees, and they have been useless (and slow). 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, August 09, 2017 9:50 AM 
To: Barry J. Cohen 
Subject: Re: [External] 

sorry, that i knew- did we know what steve paid him. i think he will get you accurate numbers that is step 1. and 
the most important. so good work. he is an upgrade to the other Joe . what is e and y s role. so far , or in the future in 
your mind. 

On Wed, Aug 9, 2017 at 9:36 AM, Barry J. Cohen < <mailto > wrote: 

A little complicated on the way in, but I think $400K salary plus target bonus of $140K. 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> ] 
Sent: Wednesday, August 09, 2017 9:01 AM 
To: Barry J. Cohen 
Subject: [External] 

what is joe v s compensation? 
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please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the person or entity to whom they 
are addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or 
other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended 
recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in error please contact the sender and delete the material from 
any computer. Apollo Global Management, LLC 
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