
From: Larry 
Sent: Sunday, July 23, 2017 12:15 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

Ok,. 4pm confirmed,,, 
I'll obtain pricing for G550 tomorrow 
Thx 
Larry&n=sp; 

Sent from my iPad 

On Jul 23, 2017, at 8:09 AM, jef=rey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com</=» wrote: 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 

w=eels up 4pm. tomorw prices on painting? 

please n=te 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidenti=l, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information,=and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of=br>JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication o= any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you hav= received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately byreturn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication a=d all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served 
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