
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Talk to me first 

On Mon, Jul 24, 2017 at 4:44 PM 
> wrote: 

jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Monday, July 24, 2017 10:42 PM 

Re: 

<mailto 

Jeffrey.. I'm very so=ry to disturb you They don't take care ab=ut me at all.. 
I need your advice.. may I wri=e that I won't be able to come back until] I II get direct deposit cherk through my Chase 
account. Or it II be too rude? 

 Forwarded messa e 
From: Gian=aria Cassani 
Date: Mon, Jul 24, 2017 at 4:29 PM=br>Sub ect: Re: 
To: 

Cc: Evelina Fernande 

Hi 

I talked to our CFO and It wont bra problem too give you an advance.<=div> 

Please be aware that your first day of job will be this Thursday 07.27= so you need to be in NY on Wednesday 

Best, 
GIANMARIA C. 
Director of Women's Division & 

WE MO=ED 
341 W=st 38th Street NY, NY 
Major Model NYC 

www.majormodel.com <http://www.majormodel.comh 

Follow us: 
Women's Blog I Men's Blog 

www.majormodeltv.com <http://www.majormodeltv.com/> 

BOOKING CONDITIONS: 
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+ CANCELLATION POLICY: On confirmed bookings: Within three working days, fu=l fee. Within five working days, half 
fee. 
+ OVERTIME RATES: Time-and-a-half apply after 8 hours in-studio up to 10 ho=rs, and 10 hours on location up to 12 
hours. 
Double time after 10 hours in-studio and 12 hours on location. On Saturdays= Sundays and Holidays day rate based on 
an 8 hour day. 
+ LINGERIE AND MEN'S UNDERWEAR RATES: Applies for Bras, Panties, Briefs= 
+ Boxers, Slips, Pantyhose, Sleepwear, Transparent 
or Translucent articles. Agency must check with model before accepting any =ingerie bookings. 
+ WEATHER PERMIT: On Confirmed Bookings: All same day cancellations =93 
+ Half fee if services are immediately rescheduled; Full fee 
if services not rescheduled. Weather permit cancellations made earlier are =ubject to normal cancellation policy. 
+ WEATHER PERMIT OPTIONS: Book or release will be enforced for options when=secondary job is ready to confirm. 
+ USE RIGHTS: Are limited to the specific rights granted and may not be ext=nded without negotiations. 

From <=a» 
Date: Monday, July 24, 2017 at 3:36=PM 
To: Christian Paris 
Cc: Evelina Fernandez 

Subject: Re: 

Hello Christian. 

I won't be able to afford my come back to the city until I II =et at least 6000$-8000$ from the accountant. 
Last time when I ask about my money, I got only 800$. 
please let me know how much money is waiting for me in NY. 

Looking forward for your answer by email. 

Thank You. 

24 MORA 2017 r., a 2:23 PM, Christian Pa=is 
> Hankican( =B0): 

Need to know ASAP when you =ill be back in town, you booked out until the 24th of July and tomorrow, i= is the 
25th, so basically you should be here, are you here in NY or, at 1=ast on your way ? You are already booked for 
Thursday 7/27 so i am awaiting for your quick r=sponses. 

Thank you. 

Christian 

=C2 please note 
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The information contained in this communication =s confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
in=ide information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It =s the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of thi= communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be=unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please noti=y us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com> , and des=roy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved 
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