
From: Russell Hernandez < 
Sent: Sunday, June 10, 2018 2:14 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Rimco 

For what? 
I'm sorry I cou=d not get more from these guys but it all comes around 

Russell Hernandez 

On Jun 10, 201=, at 10:05 AM, jeffrey E. <jeev=cation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>  wrote: 

sorry 

On Sun, Jun 10, 2018 at 8:03 AM Russell Hernandez < > wrote:<=r> 

My promised was to w=rk them to get a refund 

They have offered $1000 4=80*m working on $3000. 

The owner of cater=illar has asked me to do something for him in Puerto Rico I have pushed him=to help 
as well 

Russell Hernandez 

On Mar 14, 2018, at 8:48 PM, R=chard Kahn «mailto: > wrote: 

contrary to your promise we have received $0 back from Rimco which i= clearly your 
responsibility.. 

please advise 
thank you<=div> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floo= 
New York, NY 10022 
tel c=div> 
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p=ease note 

The information contained in this communication is 
con=idential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside infor=ation, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the prop=rty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communi=ation or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If=you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.=om> , and 
destroy this commun=cation and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all=rights reserved 
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