
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Monday, July 24, 2017 6:55 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: Sonam 

please advise on 50k or 45k for sonam based on email =elow thank you 

Richard Kahn 

New York. NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Tsering Dolma 

Subject: =/b>Sonam 

Date: =/b>July 24, 2017 at 2:12:24 PM =DT 

To: =/b>Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 

Cc: "glenn@greenhousestaffing.com <mailto:glenn@greenhousestaffing.com> " 
<glenn@greenhousestaffing.com> 

Hi Richard, 

I spoke with Sonam and she said she is very much interested in the job and would love to work for the principal. 
She is looking for a long term job. She said if principal will offer her 50k gross per year without insurance, she will be go 
for it. BTW: Your salaries is way below the market for experience and qualified housekeepers. 

Even though she said ok for 45k, she will not be happy with the salary and she will continue looking for another 
job,which I don't want her to do. If you could offer her 50k gross, she will be happy and will stay at the job. 

let me know your opinion. 

Best, 
Tsering 
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Tsering Dolma 
Placement Specialist 
Greenhouse Agcy, Ltd. 
Phone: 212.889.7505 Fax: 212.889.3673 
tsering@greenhousestaffing.=om 

Search & Recruitment of QUALIFIED; "Professional-Career Household/Domestic Staff IIIII" 
Securing the best jobs for "Experienced, Well Trained, Career Minded, Household/Domestic =rofessionals" 

••Please take a look at our always updated & =mmensely-helpful website: www.greenhousestaffing.com=/span> 

See all of the new services we have to offer. Find Jobs, Share Stories and Meet Our Staff. 
All Comments & Suggestions are welcome & truly appreciated! 

"Household/Domestic Staff & Those Who Employ News Articles From Around The World": 
www.greenhousestaffing.com=blog 

Write A Review I Leave a Comment I View Available Jobs I View Available Candidates 

••"Please see us on Facebook and give us a "like!!" 

55 West 39th Street, Suite 308 
New York, NY 10018 
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