
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 11, 2017 7:40 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Peggy 

its to her co fee 

On Tue, Jul 11, 2017 at 3:01 PM, Ric=ard Kahn < 

to peggy individ=ally / loan? / gift? split? 
please advise 
thank you 

<mailto > wrote: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel <tel:(212)%20971-1306> fax <=a> cell <tel:(917)%20414-7584> 

On Jul 11, 2017, at 1:14 PM, jeffre= E. < <mailtojeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

rich send peggy siegal =A0 30k thanks 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may =e attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is=intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JE= 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or an= part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have r=ceived this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
=eturn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication =nd all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights=reserved 
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plea=e note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confi=ential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside inform=tion, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the prop=rty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
commun=cation or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. =f you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immed=ately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gm=il.com> , and 
destroy this c=mmunication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyrigh= -all rights reserved 
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