From: Richard Kahn < -

Sent: Friday, July 6, 2018 6:42 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

Only an FYl we can do 15k per gift in 2018.=nbsp;

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associat=s Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Fl=or
New York, NY 10022

On Jul 6, 2018, at 2:34 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:
=br>

transfer 28k =to karyna to forward on to her parents for 2018 gifts.

please=note

The information contained in this communication is
confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside informatio=, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property o=
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication=or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you h=ve received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by=br=return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= , and
destroy this communicatio= and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all right= reserved
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