
From: Governor Kenneth E. Mapp 
Sent: Sunday, July 9, 2017 6:38 PM 
To: Erika Kellerhals; Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

Please do not forward them to Winston & Strewn. I will discuss the matt=r with them and Art Hiebert will contact you. 

From: Erika Kellerhals 
Sent: Sunday, July 09, 2017 1:40:18 PM 
To: Jeffrey E.; Governor Kenneth E. Mapp 
Subject: Re: 

Good afternoon. Thank you Governor for following up= We have been sending invoices monthly to Peter Hiebert via our 
bill=ng system and despite numerous conversations with him about the invoices, this was the first we were advised that 
he did not=have all of them in his possession. To ensure that there were no further i=sues, I asked my staff to make sure 
that the invoices were being iss=ed in Peter's name with a notation of Government of the Virgin Islands and further, to 
resend all 9 invoices to =im. This was done on Friday. I shall confirm with him tomorrow am th=t he received them. 

Thank you again. 

Erika A. Kellerhals 

Member 

Kellerhals Ferguson Kroblin PLLC 

Royal Palm Professional Building 

9053 Estate Thomas, Suite 101 

St. Thomas, VI 00802 

Tel: <tel 

email: <mailto 
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Notice: This communication may contain privile=ed or other confidential information. If you are not the intended 
re=ipient, or believe that you have received this communication in error, ple=se do not print, copy, re-transmit, 
disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Also, please indicate to the send=r that you have received this e-mail in 
error, and delete the copy you rec=ived. Thank you. 

Circular 230: To ensure compliance with the requirem=nts imposed by the IRS, we inform you that any tax advice 
contained in our=communication (including any attachments) was not intended or written to b= used, and cannot be 
used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding any tax penalty or (ii) promoting, marketing or re=ommending to another party any 
transaction or matter addressed herein. 

From: Erika Kellerhals <ekellerhals@kellfer.com> 
Date: Thursday, June 22, 2017 at 9:50 AM 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>, "Gove=nor Kenneth E. Mapp" <govkenmapp@go.vi.gov> 
Subject: Re: 

We are checking with Winston and Strawn now. The in=oices are actually issued by our firm. 

Erika A. Kellerhals 

Member 

Kellerhals Ferguson Kroblin PLLC 

Royal Palm Professional Building 

9053 Estate Thomas, Suite 101 

St. Thomas, VI 00802 

Tel: 888 316 9269 <tel:340%20779%202564> 

email: ekellerhals@kellfer.com <mailto:ekellerhals@kellfer.co=> 
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Notice: This communication may contain privile=ed or other confidential information. If you are not the intended 
re=ipient, or believe that you have received this communication in error, ple=se do not print, copy, re-transmit, 
disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Also, please indicate to the send=r that you have received this e-mail in 
error, and delete the copy you rec=ived. Thank you. 

Circular 230: To ensure compliance with the requirem=nts imposed by the IRS, we inform you that any tax advice 
contained in our=communication (including any attachments) was not intended or written to b= used, and cannot be 
used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding any tax penalty or (ii) promoting, marketing or re=ommending to another party any 
transaction or matter addressed herein. 

From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Thursday, June 22, 2017 at 6:48 AM 
To: "Governor Kenneth E. Mapp" <govkenmapp@go.vi.gov>=, Erika Kellerhals <ekellerhals@kellfer.com> 

did peter heibert deal with blums invoic=s. 

please no=e 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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