From: I

Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2017 2:20 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

They needed to buy a good behavior ticket with ECB - at our expense .
We had already provisioned in 2016 10 mio for the fine What matters is that s it s behind us

Ariane de Rothschild

On 28 Jun 2017, at 13:39, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

i just saw your csf fine . sounfair. as you recall my justice guy said they will only settle for 10m dollars .
forget how they calculate itis a number they want. though the revenie was only 4.  what a time
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