From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2017 9:31 PM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: lulls

Geta 2 or 3 year old

On Tue, Jun 27, 2017 at 5:24 PM Richard Kahn || NG - ote:<=r>

it appears that we purchased lull in 2012=and boom lift in 2015

shall i seek exact specs desired from sher=dan and then present to your for purchase using a budget of 50-65k
before =hipping

please advise

thank you

<f=iv>

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace _gt;

Subject: <=span=Re: lulls

Date: Jlune 27, 2017 at 1:31:32 PM EDT
<=span:
To

Greetings=Rich,

| lumped both lulls together because it will be d=fficult to separate out most of the 2007 vs 2005 lull cost
due to how we c=ded the invoices. Going forward we will be more meticulous in tracki=g the costs of individual pieces
of equipment, especially if we own more t=an one of a type of machine.
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The attached spreads=eet has 4 categories:

1. Lull Purchases: =C2¢ 5108,175.00
2. Trucking, Shipp=ng, etc: 5 18,798.01

3. Parts, Labor Materials: =C2€ S5 78,662.88
4. Tire Purchases, Repair: =u>5 20,174.01

©=A0 =C2@ $225,809.90

=div>

On Tue, Jun 27, 2017 at 11:08 AM, Richard Kahn —
<mailto | > ¥ 0te:

thank you

dont go crazy..

“=[>

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor
New York, NY 10022

On Jun 27, 2017, at 12:07 PM, Daphne Wallace_: wrote:

Greetings Rich,

| should=have the analysis to you shortly - trying to group the costs in a way that=makes

Sense,
On Tue, Jun 27, 2017 at 9:53 AM, Richard Kahn _,.-’::::-
wrote:
can you please send =e analysis on the 2 lulls we currently own - cost / repairs
etc

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
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New York, NY 10022

z=div>

=A0 please note

The information contained in this communicati=n is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute=inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. =t is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of =his
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may=be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:=eevacation@gmail.com> , and
=estroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved
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