From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, July 7, 2017 9:30 PM
To: Eric Roth
Subject: Re: FW: G550 rosen 19" monitor specs

will the picture be clearer? also give m= a time frame for the counter tops. , as my aug schedule is no= screwed. im
not sure what another week if needbe adds. =

On Fri, Jul 7, 2017 at 11:11 PM, Eric Roth | - wrote:

Jeffrey below is the specification(s) =or your review of the monitor we would propose to replace the
existing.=/u>

I will have pricing on Monday for the =nstall if you approve this monitor. | estimate the cost for the moni=or,
engineering, install and certification to be approximately 518,000 - 521,000.

Best Regards,

Eric

ERIC H. ROTH<=> | PRESIDENT
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2221 S=ithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779<=>

From: lay Massar
Sent: Friday, July 07, 2017 4:59 PM

To Eric Roth I >

Subject: G550 rosen 19" monitor specs

http://www.rosenaviat=on.com/files/4614,/9212/3878/Technical _Manual_1900.pdf
<http://www.rosenaviation.com/files/4614/9=12/3878/Technical_Manual_1900.pdf> =u>

JAY MASSAR | OPERATIONS MGR<=>

<=p>

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacAr=hur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779

=AD please note

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a
href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com” target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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