
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2017 6:58 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: Chip G550 

yes 

On Wed, Jun 28, 2017 at 2:15 PM, Larry Visoski =gt; wrote: 

Jeffery 
Chip is due G550 recurrent in Aug,. Cost $22.9k 
Should we send him to class? No daily pay,. Just training and expense. 
Do you approve? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
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