From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, July 6, 2018 6:57 PM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re:

send me a note. . re ribis | think the =ine will be greater than the 75k we had to pay last time. €=A0 very bad.

On Fri, Jul 6, 2018 at 2:41 PM, Richard Kahn

wrote:

Only an FY| we can do 15k per gift in 2018.

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates=Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
<https://maps.google.=om/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue,+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022 Rentry=gma=|&source=g>
MNew Yor=, NY 10022
<https://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lexington+Ave=ue, +4th+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022&entry=gmail &source=g>
Phone 212-971-1306
Fax 646-350-0954

ce I

On Jul 6, 2018, at 2:=4 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and a=| copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights rese=ved
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