
From: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, June 22, 2017 5:54 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Cecile final loan payment 

original balance due was 50k 
less 20k =ec 2016 bonus applied 
balance 30k plus =nterest 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Cecile de Jongh 

Subject: =/b>Payment 

Date: =/b>June 22, 2017 at 11:11:31 AM =DT 

To: =/b>Rich Kahn 

Reply-To: =/b>Cecile de Jongh 

Hi =ich, 

I am sending you =ia FedEx a check for $31,060.99. Thank you very much for =verything. 

With warm =egards, 

Cecile de =ongh 
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