From: Richard Kahn _
Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2017 9:44 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Fwd: Chip G550

larry sent me your approval on chip
we both =eel that chip should be responsible for his own hotel costs, airfare =nd food and Plan D just pays 22,900 please
advise =f ok thanks

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor
New =ork, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:
Subject: =/b>Re: Chip =550

Date: =/b>lune 28, 2017 at 2:39:49 PM =DT

Ok,. Yes,, airline , hotel and =ood,,.
| agree,.

Sent from my iPad

On Jun =8, 2017, at 2:26 PM, Richard Kahn _ wrote:

what is expense?
hotel =ood? estimated cost
i feel he should be =esponsible for that

Richard Kahn

HBRK =ssociates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th =loor
New York, NY 10022
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On Jun 28, 2017, at 2:15 PM, Larry Visoski _ =rote:

Jeffery

Chip is due G550 recurrent in Aug,. =ost $22.9k

Should we send him to class? No daily pay,. =ust training and expense.
Do you approve?

Thx
Larry

Sent =rom my iPhone
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