From: Erika Kellerhals {_b

Sent: Thursday, June 22, 2017 1:50 PM
To: jeffrey E.; Governor Kenneth E. Mapp
Subject: Re:

We are checking with Winston and Strawn now. The=invoices are actually issued by our firm.
Erika A. Kellerhals

Member

Kelle=hals Ferguson Kroblin PLLC

Royal Palm Prof=ssional Building

9053 Estate Thomas, Suite=101

5t. Thomas, VI 00802

Fax: [ I

Motic=: This communication may contain privileged or other confidential inf=rmation. If you are not the intended
recipient, or believe that you h=ve received this communication in error, please do not print, copy, re-tran=mit,
disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Also, please ind=cate to the sender that you have received this e-mail in
error, and delete =he copy you received. Thank you.

&nb=p;

From: =/span>"=effrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Thursday, Jun= 22, 2017 at 6:48 AM

To: "Governor Kenneth E. Mapp" «:_>, Erika Kellerhals <_><=:F>

EFTA_R1_01884901
EFTA02647171



did peter heibert deal with blums invo=ces.

=please note

The information contained=in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged= may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosu=e or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohi=ited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in =rror, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com= and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all=attachments. copyright -
all rights reserved
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