
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, May 26, 2017 1:58 PM 
To: Jon Tomlinson 
Subject: Re: 

Yes thx 

On Fri, May 26, 2017 at 9:5= AM Jon Tomlinson < » wrote: 

Just so we're completely clear here =80 I assume you're sending the gift tax return to the auditor d=rectly next 
week, correct? 

I've set up a confer=nce call today with the CPA and 
auditor visit. 

=div> 

The information contained in this communic=tion is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constit=te inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies 

thereof, 

at 5 pm to go over everything i=cluding the 

On May 26, 2017, at 7:55 AM, jeffrey E. &=t;jeevacation@g=ail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

will send to agent wed next week 

=C2 please note 

including all atta=hments. copyright -all rights reserved 

=AO please note 

The information conta=ned in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privi=eged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for th= use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
d=sclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strict=y prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
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received this communic=tion in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-ma=l to 
jeevacatio=@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies 
thereof,<=r>including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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