
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, June 5, 2017 4:41 PM 
To: William Blum 
Subject: Re: Fees 

i know i have to do something , he did not meet with=me yet. many texts dealying it. odd =AO including one today 

On Mon, Jun 5, 2017 at 12:37 PM, William Blum 

Jeff — 

<=pan style="font-size:11.0ptcolor:140d0d0d"> </=> 

Any=update? 

Bill 

<=.1> 

William =A0Blum I Partner 

=/span> 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> I 
Sent: Thursday, May 25, 2017 4:=8 PM 
To: William Blum 
Subject: Re: Fees<=span> 

he postposned it until tues 

On =hu, May 25, 2017 at 2:57 PM, William Blum 

Hi, Jeff. Any report after you spoke with the Governor.=u> 

Bill 
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gspan> 

=illiam Blum I Partner 

SOLOMON BLUM HEYMANN LLP =AO =C2 =AO 
40 Wall =treet, 35th floor 
New York, NY 10005 

Tel 

Fax=u> 

Emai= 

<=span> 

From:<=b> Jeffrey E. imailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gmail.com> ] 
Sent: Thursday, Ma= 18, 2017 6:51 PM 
To: William Blum 
Subject: Re: Fees<kpan> 

=p class="MsoNormal">understood , i am meeting with the=governore this week, he thought it imporant that the 
govt pay,=C2 for pr purposes at a minimum , not nice, =AO ill report back aft3r the meeting 

On Thu, May 18, 2017 at 6:46 PM, William Blum 

Hi, Jeff. I hope all is well. =A0 

As you know we completed most of our work on the legislati=e project for you (now the "Financial Services 
Improvement Act of =017") over six months ago. However, the bulk of our fees for=this project (billed through Erika's 
firm) have not yet been paid =nd we have been patiently waiting for that to happen. =/p> 

E=ika tells me that this may have to do with the fact that the Governor pref=rred to have the fees paid by his office or by 
Peter Hiebert's fir=. Exactly who cuts the check to us is not that important to us, but =ince you are the client and you 
engaged us for this work, we have no choic= but to look to you for payment. 
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=c2 

Can you please arrange to mare payment now? Erika can provide you with the exact amount if you ne=d it. If you want 
to discuss, of course I am available. 

=ours, 

Bill 

Fax</=> 

Email 

=/td> 

</=iv> 

=U> 

=C2 please note 

The i=formation contained in this communication is confidential, may be attor=ey-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intender only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Una=thorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part t=ereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received =his communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e=mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all =opies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserve= 
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