
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, May 26, 2017 5:02 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Bentley 

Ok 

On Fri, May 26, 2017 at 12=27 PM Richard Kahn < <mailto 
wrote: 

> > 

attached is final invoice totaling 278,120.=4 which included 10,000 discount negotiated, 50,000 deposit and 
135,000 me=cedes trade 

everything looks good and the onnly issue i am waiti=g on an explanation is personalized plaque on sticker for 
2555 which we we=e never told about 

please advise if ok to wire funds for balance=with 2555 holdback 

additionally what time would y=u like to receive car on tuesday and at 9 east 71st or at showroom </=iv> 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Asso=iates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

=br class="m_-1199334081273941136Apple-interchange-newline"> 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Gary Price < 

Subject:=Re: Menu 

Date: May 23, 2017 at 4:04:35 PM EDT<=r> 
To: Richard Kahn < <mailto 

Cc: Danielle Weinstein < 

Here you go.=. 

> > 
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Gary Price • Director of Finance • 
</=> 

Email 

Manhattan Motorc=rs • Porsche of Princeton •Porsche of Huntington •=Classic Audi 
711 Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019http://w=w.manhattanmotorcars.com 

chttp://www.manhattanmotorcars.com/> 

<https://ww=.facebook.com/manhattanmotorcars> 4*=A0 
<https://plus.google.com/115514254358983853252/about> <http://www.youtube.com/use=/ManhattanMcars> 
<http://www.link=din.com/company/879097?trk=tyah> 

<https://ci6.googleusercont=nt.com/proxy/78ydVIMBMqzB2reBPKK5BolX8w4GlpNuT_lpfnq4xPXOiGGDSJNJHiivAldH=y 
sZjvNMkemOaK-X4QiKxRf5rnzEncAUjA8rrNtGINsK3ahMEKDn5DZE5HXq3Ek23rcHAIHBIHs=XYAKH5NviR68daPUvm6I-
H5ew=s0-d-el-
fttfhttps://docs.google.com/a/manhattan=otorcars.com/uc?id=0B4z4fTlfPXfocWtwb2ZV5VM5N3c&export=download> 
<=p> 

Gary Price • Director=of Finance =C2Q•=br • 
Fax <=span> 

Email 

Manhattan Motorcars • Porsche of Princeton Q=A2Porsche of Huntington • Classic Audi 
711 Elev=nth Ave. New York, NY 10019 
http://www.manhatt=nmotorcars.com <http://www.manhattanmotorcar=.com/> 

<https://=ww.facebook.com/manhattanmotorcars> <https://twitter.com/ManhattanMcars> 
<https://ci6.googleusercontent.co=/proxynhycKDuTd04esGT0FnBTdC12hFwah-
oUlliZOwn9leMWoPND2Tj6wJtR348ultWmPAME=z19y.l5mrNs-hAhE9ZygR4lUfISfEbRUS=s0-d-el-
fttfhttp://htmlsig.com/images/ic=n-komodo/google-plus.png> <http://=ww.youtube.com/user/ManhattanMcars> 
<http://www.linkedin.com/company/879097?=rk=tyah> 

<https:/=ci6.googleusercontent.com/proxy/78ydVBt8Mqzf32reBPKK5BoIX8w4GlpNuT_lpfnq4x=XOiGG05.IN.IHiivAldHSy 
sZjvNMkemOaK-X4QiKxRf5rnzEncAUjA8rrNtGINsK3ahMEKDn5DZE=HXq3Ek23rcHAIHBIHs4XYAKH5NviR68daPUvm6I-
H5ew=s0-d-el-
ft#https://docs.goo=le.com/a/manhattanmotorcars.com/uc?id=0B4z4fTlfPXfocWtwb2ZVSVM5N3c&e=port=download> 

On Tue, May 23, 2017 at 3:58 PM, Richard Kah= < 
<mailto: >  wrote: 

i will need a detailed invoice in or=er to make payment 
thank you 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
57= Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

=/div> 

AudirC24* 

On May 23, 2017, at 3:58 PM, Gary Price < 

Ok...The balance due is $278,120.24. Wire instructions=attached... 

Thanks, 

=b>Gary Price 4>=A2 Director of Finance • 
> =C2Q• Cell 

Email <mailto 

<tel: 

<=a» wrote: 

Manhattan Motorcars • Porsch= of Princeton •Porsche of Huntington • Classic 

711 Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019 
http://www.manhattanmotorcar=.com <http://=ww.manhattanmotorcars.com/> 

<https://www.facebook.com/manha=tanmotorcars> 
<https://twitter=com/ManhattanMcars> <https:/=plus.google.com/115514254358983853252/about> 

Gary Price • Director =f Finance Q=A0• 
> • Cell 

<tel: -> l>=A0 
<tea:I > • Fax 

Email <http://www.linkedin.com/company/8790=7?trk=tyah> <=span> 

On Tue, May 23, 2017 at 3:53 PM, Richard Kah= < 
<mailto: >  wrote: 

we will not be transferring plates a=d will need new plates 
will send back signed authorization shortly 
thank you 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
57= Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

=/div> 

On May 23, 2017, at 3:30 PM, Gary Pr=ce < 
<mailto > wrote: 

Great! We will get going on everything now. Please sign and retu=n the attached 
authorization to do the work. Are we transferring plates fr=m the Maybach? If so I will need a copy of the registration 
which will als= be good for the proof of Corp we need. Let me know and I will send you th= balance due amount and 
wire transfer instructions... 

T=anks, 

Gary Price • Director of Finance=C2Q 
<tel > • Cell 

M<=a> 

Email 

<=a> • Fax 

Manhattan Motorcars • Porsche of Princeton •Porsche of =untington • Classic 
Audi 

711 Eleventh Ave. New =ork, NY 10019 
http://www.manhattanmotorcars.com 

<http://www.manhattanmotorcars.com/> 

<= href="https://www.facebook.com/manhattanmotorcars" target="_blank"> 
<https://twitter.com/ManhattanMcars> <https://plus.google.com/11551425435898385=252/about> 
<http://w=w.youtube.com/user/ManhattanMcars> 

<https:/=ci6.googleusercontent.com/proxy/78ydV6t8Mqzf32reBPKK5BoIX8w4GlpNuT_lpfnci4x=XOiGG05,IN.IHiivAldHSy 
sZjvNMkemOaK-X4QiKxRf5rnzEncAUjA8rrNtGINsK3ahMEKDn5DZE=HXq3Ek23rcHAIHBIHs4XYAKH5NviR68daPUvm6I-
H5ew=s0-cl-el-
fttfhttps://docs.goo=le.com/a/manhattanmotorcars.com/uc?id=0B4z4fTlfPXfocWtwb2ZVSVM5N3c&e=port=download> 

=div> 

Gary Price • Director of Finance=C2**=A2 
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• Cell <tel:i > • Fax 
<tel: => =ip> 

Email g=@manhattanmotorcars.com 

<=pan style="background-color:rgba(255,255,255,0)">Manhattan Motorcars • 
Porsche of Princeton •Porsc=e of Huntington • Classic Audi 

711 Eleventh Ave= New York, NY 10019 
http://www.manhattanmotorc=rs.com 

<http://www.manhattanmotorcars.com/> 

<https://www.face=ook.com/manhattanmotorcars> 
<https://twitter.com/ManhattanMcars> <https:=/plus.google.com/115514254358983853252/about> 
<http://www.youtubr.com/user/ManhattanMcars> <http://www.linkedin.com/company/879097?trk=tya=> 

chttps://ci6.goog=eusercontent.com/proxy/78ydVIRBMqzf32reBPKK5BolX8w4GlpNuT_lpfnci4xPXOiGGDS.I=JHiivAldHSy 
sZjvNMkemOaK-X4QiKxRf5rnzEncAUjA8rrNtGINsK3ahMEKDn5DZE5I-IXq3Ek23=cHAIHBIHs4XYAKH5NviR68daPUvm6I-
H5ew=s0-d-el-
ftnhttps://docs.google.com/a=manhattanmotorcars.com/uc?id=084z4fTlfPXfocWtwb2ZVSVMSN3c&export=d=wnload> 

On Tue, May 23, 2017 at 2:37 PM, Richard Kah= < 
<mailto: >  wrote: 

thank you 
yes we will also go wi=h Ceramic Pro for 3850 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
57= Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

=/div> 

On May 23, 2017= at 2:05 PM, Gary Price < 
<mailto > wrote: 

<tel: > =C240 

Email 

• Cell <tel:i > • Fax 
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=anhattan Motorcars • Porsche of Princeton •Porsche of Hunt=ngton • Classic 
Audi 

711 Eleventh Ave. New York= NY 10019 
http://www.manhattanmotorcars.com 

<http://www.manhattanmotorcars.com/> 

=/a> =img 
src="https://ci6.googleusercontent.com/proxy/akjH9qPrAf_s2v6vk3gQvLU=0INIOrlhXzoRdi43IjozQc1pidmxl9Twi8qiEAv 
YTY47jpeX3dLM7tcV2bnKxOdrvRdBgYcuew=3Ds0-d-el-ftithttp://htmlsig.com/images/icon-komodo/twitter-2.png" 
alt="T=itter"> <https://twitter.com/ManhattanMcars> <https://plus.google.com/115514254358983853252/=bout> 
<http://www.yo=tube.com/user/ManhattanMcars> </=> 

<https://ci6.g=ogleusercontent.com/proxy/78ydV8t8Mqzf32re8PKISBoIX8w4GlpNuT_lpfnc4xPXOiGG=SJNJHiivAldHSys 
ZjvNMkemOaK-X4QiKxRf5rnzEncAUjA8rrNtGINsK3ahMEKDn5DZESHXq3E=23rcHAIHBIHs4XYAKH5NviR68daPUvm6I-
HSew=s0-d-el-
fthhttps://docs.google.co=/a/manhattanmotorcars.com/uc?id=0B4z4fTlfPXfocWtwb2ZVSVM5N3c&export=3Ddownload 

<=iv> 

Gary Price <=span> • Direc=or of Finance 
> • Cell <tel: 

• Fax <tel :-> =C24> 

Email 

Manhattan Motorcars • Porsche of Princeton =E2t4Porsche of Huntington • 
Classic Audi 

71= Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019 
http://www.m=nhattanmotorcars.com 

chttp://www.manhattanmo=orcars.com/> 

<https://ci6.googleusercontent.com/proxy/dx1aO-
=U8gWtz6dkq3xj4Bgnr62C58d5ZrvXpX2Td505aTkqEflikhDCTINNO2b0ickUwgqASj8nqm0=BnPLTyFcYzzG8y=s0-d-e1-
fttfhttp://htmlsig.com/images/icon-komodo/facebook=png> <https://twitter.com/ManhattanMc=rs> 
<https://ci6.googleuserconten=.com/proxy/-jhvcKDuTd04esGTDFn8TdQ2hFgQh-
oUtliZOwn9leMWoPND2Tj6w.ltR348ultWm=AME7zf9yJSmrNs-hAhE9ZvgR4IUfISfEbRUS=s0-d-el-
ft#http://htmlsig.com/image=/icon-komodo/google-plus.png> 
<https://ci3.googleusercontent.com/proxy/0UxPXzYt=DcklpV4S12Nm9r_kUY7CwsOPinI6Y9_9bOvm.IdDao6WrManFK8I 
VDfEuMlgROKcnFxkrlYlaWr=Sj2N89H7LU4=s0-d-el-ft#http://htmlsig.com/images/icon-komodo/youtube.png= alt=> 
<=span> 

On Tue, May 23, 2017 at 1:29 PM, Richard Kah= < 
<mailto: >  wrote: 

6 

EFTA_R1_01887712 

EFTA02648640



thanks for sending 
we are going =o go with the Ding and Dent Package only 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
57= Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

=/div> 

<mailto 
O= May 23, 2017, at 11:20 AM, Gary Price < 
> wrote: 
=/div> 
Here you go... 

Gary Price • Director of Finance • 
> •=Cell 

MI> =C24o• Fax <tel:(212)%20202-4218> 

Email <=a> 
<mailto:gp@manhattanmotorcars.c=m> 

Classic Audi 
711 Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019 
http://www.manhattanmotorcars.com 

<http://www.manhattanmotorcars.com/> 

<tea 

Manhattan Motor=ars • Porsche of Princeton *Porsche of Huntington 4,=A2 

<= style="font-size:12.8000001907349px"> 
<https://www.facebook.com/manhattanmotor=ars> 
<https://ci6.googleusercontent.com/proxy/akjH9q=rAf_s2v6vk3gQvLUt0bqlOrlhXzoRdi43Ijozraclpidmxl9Twi8qiEAvYTY4 
7jpeX3dLM7tcV2=nKxOdryRdBgYcuew=s0-d-el-fttlhttp://htmlsig.com/images/icon-komodo/twitte=-2.png> 
<https://plus.google.com/11551=254358983853252/about> <http://www.youtube.com/user/ManhattanMca=s> 
<https://ci3.googleusercontent.com/=roxy/nVFfzp_wHlduYobNDbIuohMl27nnlDASgJuNFzu7cf8hN3J_3ZfIIEK9xfK-
v_0VM-0eW=Z5lOBzXudBLGqowg0KpD4IqAOf=s0-d-e1-ftt$http://htmlsig.com/images/icon-kom=do/linkedin.png> 

<https://ci6.googleusercontent.com/proxy=78ydVBt8Mqz132reBPKK5BolX8w4GlpNuT_lpfnq4xPXOiGGD5JNJHiivAldHSy 
sZjvNMkemOa=-X4QiKxRf5rnzEncAUjA8rrNtGINsK3ahMEKDn5DZE5HXq3Ek23rcHAIHBIHs4XYAKH5NviR68=aPUvm6I-
H5ew=s0-d-el-
ft#https://docs.google.com/a/manhattanmotorcars.com=tic?id=084z4fTlfPXfocWtwb2ZVSVM5N3c&export=download> 
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=/div> 
<NES Menu.pdf> 

<NES F=nal.pdf> 

</=iv> 

=div> 

conversation-id 42920 date-last-viewed 0 date-received 1495818121 flags 
8590195713 gmail-label-ids 7 remote-id 717096 
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