From: Richard Kahn <[ -

Sent: Tuesday, May 16, 2017 6:53 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Fwd: ZM 5500

i will approve now but typical brice
mercedes 4,650 repair plus tax now needs additional part for =,200
6,850 x 1.06 = 7,261 total cost with =ax..

Richard =ahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:
from: z01 < <roivo S - >
Subject: Re: ZM 5500

Date: May 16, 2017 at 2:44:28 PM EDT

To: Richard kahn <N
ce: Zorro Ranch < < - >
Rich

The Mercedes needs one additional =art, brake booster module

Cost S2200.00

All

Other parts have been installed , =he unit is sending sparatic

Sent =rom my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: =/b>zM <[

Subject: =/b=Re: ZM =500
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Date: =/b=May 16, 2017 at 2:47:29 PM =DT

To: =/b>Richard Kahn <[
ce: Zorro Ranch <| -

Sorry sent before finishing message

Brake Booster module is =ending error code
Car can be driven but abs =ill not function correctly
Can we proceed with =epair ?

Sent from my =Phone

On May 16, 2017, at 12:44 PM, =M </ <o to - > «rote:

Rich

The =ercedes needs one additional part, brake booster module
Cost $2200.00

All

Other parts have been installed , the unit is sending =paratic

Sent from my =Phone

On May 9, 2017, at 12:10 PM, =rice Gordon f._ <mailtn_> =

wrote:

Rich

attached estimate to repair 2002 5500 =ercedes

Repair consist of

new, battery, ESP =nit{ABS) Shift Selector, Steering wheel adjuster

total cost 54650.00, =lus tax

Estimated value of vehicle is around 40K, see =ttached link

http://www.2040-cars.com/Mercedes-Benz/5-Class/2002-mercedes-be=z-s500-guard-armored--
458849/

how do you wish to =roceed?
regards Brice

On Mon, =ay 8, 2017 at 7:15 AM, Richard Kahn < ||| - ot

before repair is done please =ets discuss cost
thank you
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Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

On May 8, 2017, at 9:00 AM, =M <|
{mailtu—} = wrote:

For the record

The Mercedes S500 will be towed =0 ABQ today

The brake module has failed

Therefore transmission can not be engaged

| =ontacted Mercedes of ABQ regarding fault, only fix is to have car towed =o
dealer in ABQ

<IMG_5085.1PG>

Sent from my =Phone

Brice Gordon
Stanley, =M

ph:

<ZM 5500 =epairs.pdf>
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