
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, May 26, 2017 7:04 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: boyson credit 

Richard =ahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Daphne Wallace 

Subject: =/b>Re: boyson =redit 

Date: =/b>May 26, 2017 at 3:02:24 PM =DT 

To: =/b>Richard Kahn 

Cc: ann rodriquez 

Greetings =ich, 

Yes, the =redit on the Boyson account is $23,412.50. Anna spoke with JR =his afternoon. JR and his sister Sherie 
Boynes have been our =irect contacts in Boyson for logistics and accounting =iscussions. 

Per=JR, Boyson is running again with the "Mr. B" barge. The assets =or Boyson are currently tied up in the 
courts due to the bankruptcy =iling. 

They =re prepared to service GSJ with transporting trucks to and from STT, =tarting after July 4, 2017. 

They wish to have a sit-down with =E. 

I then =ontacted Sherrie regarding the use of the credit at the time that =oyson would again begin transporting 
trucks for GSJ. She =cknowledged the credit, and did not dispute when I told her the amount =f $23K. She says she will 
speak with the lawyer, but she believes it =ay be half and half; i.e., if Boyson makes 4 runs, 2 runs can be =pplied to the 
standing credit, and 2 would not. 
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She plans to speak with her lawyer this =eek, and will get something in writing. 

On Fri, May 26, 2017 at 1:03 PM, Richard Kahn =span dir="ltr" class="" wrote: 

i believe we are owed =pproximately 23,000 in credit 
jee mentioned he will be =eginning gsj work soon and thinks their barge would be =elpful 
can you please reach out and inquire how =nd when we can use credits 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. =Y 10022 
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