
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2018 1:32 PM 
To: lvjet 
Subject: Re: GIV engine overhaul 

yes 

On Wed, May 30, 2018 at 9:06 AM Larry Visoski wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
planning ahead, 
Since Eric can't take the G550 until July 30th., 
Kathleen at Rolls Royce Corporate care, offered us loaner engines Mid July,= 
Should I make a reservation July 15 to have them installed so the GIV will =e ready by July 30th when we drop 

the G550 off at Eric's? 
(Install of Dual engines should take less than 10days) I'll confirm=with Rusty today. 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

=C2 please note 

The information co=tained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for 

JEE 
Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited and may be 
unlawful. If you have received this commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e=mail to 
jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereo=, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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