From: Eric Roth

Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2017 3:32 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: RE: Re:

I will send a revised quote with an invoice to Richard and cc you and Larry.

Best Regards,

Eric

ERICH. ROTH | PRESIDENT

www.intljet.com
=http://www.intljet.com/> <http://twitter.com/#!/intljet> <http://www.facebook.com/intljet>

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, May 09, 2017 11:20 AM

Subject: Re:

send invoices to eric for what can be done. please.

On Tue, May 9, 2017 at 11:17 AM, Eric Roth ||| G -
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Breaking up the refurbishment limits certain work — especially as it relates to modifications (galley area /
possibly lav vanity).

We can however accomplish:
* Carpet
¥ Lower side panels
. Cabin single seats
Divans

Fwd and aft lavatory potty seats

Crew Seats

If there was any way you would consider flying the GIV for just another & weeks or even split the & wgeeks
between the GIV and the potential BBJ, then we could accomplish EVERYTHING — including paint.

Best Regards,

Eric

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT

www.intljet.com <http://www.intljet.com/> <http://twitter.com/#!/intljet>
<http://www.facebook.com/intljet=>
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From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com: |
Sent: Tuesday, May 09, 2017 11:12 AM

To: ric Roth

Subject:
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please note

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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