
From: Larry 
Sent: Friday, May 12, 2017 7:42 AM 
To: Je vacation; Rich Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: G550 sn 5173 

Jeffrey, 
<=iv id="AppleMailSignature">See attached original number from Eric., Appears Eric increased his price for recover of 
the 6 main Cabin seat=,. 
Originally he quoted $116,800 for all 8 seats (=14,600 each seat) 

 Forwa=ded message 
From: Eric Roth= 
Date: Tue, Apr 25, 2017 at 12:13 PM 
Subject: RE: G550=sn 5173 
To: "Jeffrey E." <je=vacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 

Date: 4.24.17 

Client: JE 

Aircraft: G550 

Serial Number: 5173 

soft goods 

Price 

$ 3,767.=0 

3,294.=0 

203 Upper Side Wall Panels 

$ 3,256.=0 

204 Lower Side Wall Panels 

$ 5,713.=0 

205 Glareshield 

$ 2,133.=0 
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206 Bulkhead Panels 

= $ 3,058.=0 

207 Center pedestal 

= $ 1,074.4 

208 Crew Seats 

$ 11,230.00 

209 Control column boots 

1,459.=0 

210 Jepp storage 

$ &=bsp; 824.00 

211 Crew privacy curtain 

$ 2,022.=0 

225 Floor Covering (Cockpit)<=p> $ 4,419.=0 

230 Cockpit Paint / Touch up<=p> $ 1,473.=0 

Price 

301 Headliner Panels 

$ 2,620.=0 

304 Airstair Treatment<=p> $ 4,58a=0 

311 Fwd Lavatory Upper Sidewall Panel 

$ 1,098.=0 

314 R/H Fwd Lay Potty Seat 

$ 2,533.=0 

320 Jumpseat 

$ 8,425.=0 

325 Floor Covering (Entryway)=/p> $ 1,272.=0 

Price 
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401 Headliner Panels 

$ 9,825.=0 

402 R/H & L/H PSU / Valance Panels</=> 

$ 13,535.00 

406 Window Line Panels 

$ 13,915.00 

409 Lower Side Panels 

$ 14,730.00 

412 Fwd Cabin Bulkheads 

$ 3,973.=0 

416 Aft Cabin Bulkheads 

3,973.=0 

420 Cabin Single Seats (8) 

116,800.00 

422 Divan(s)-2-

$ 49,190.00 

423 Divan End Arm Cabinets 

$ 4,392.=0 

425 Floor Covering 

$ 38,235.00 

Price 

501 Headliner Panels 

$ 1,897.=0 

525 Floor Covering (Galleyk/=> $ &=bsp; 636.00 

Price 

601 Headliner Panels 
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$ 1,897.=0 

606 Potty Seat & Shroud 

$ 3,794.=0 

611 Aft Lavatory R/H Closet</=> 

612 Aft Lavatory L/H Closet</=> 

625 Floor Covering (Aft Lavatory) 

&=bsp; 848.00 

Price 

701 Recover Panels 

$ 11,605.00 

703 Baggage Door Vinyl Flap 

$ &=bsp; 737.00 

725 Floor Covering 

$ 3,772.=0 

730 Paint / Touch Up 

$ 3,505.=0 

Price 

801 Remove Interior/ Inc. Inspection=u> 

$ 14,500.00 

802 Install Interior / Detail in Aircraft=/u> 

$ 33,050.00 

803 Fire Blocking (jump, 3 materials in main)</=> 

$ 50,820.00 

804 Vertical / Composite Burn Cert. 

$ 7,566.=0 

807 Maintenance Runner(s) 

$ 4,580.=0 

$ 4,580.=0 
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$ 2,134.=0 

829 Engineering / Certificate=/p> $ 1,70a=o 

836 Exterior Paint - ballast for paint</=> 

$ S,020.=0 

woodwork & finish 

Price 

801 Remove Interior/ Inc. Inspection=u> 

$ 11,850.00 

802 Install Interior / Detail in Aircraft=/u> 

$ 43,653.00 

806 Woodwork (all plus finish)=/span> 

$ 373,267.00 

808 Install Placards 

Hangar Rent 

modifications 

Price 

317 Forward Crew Galley 

$ 5,267.=0 

402 R/H & L/H P511/ Valance Panels - closeout<=> 

$ 8,425.=0 

406 Window Line Panels 

$ 7,789.=0 

5 

EFTA_R1_01891919 

EFTA02650911



407 R/H & L/H Drinkrail / Ledges=/span> 

$ 3,572.=0 

410 Side Wall Tables (rare earth mag, supports)=/u> 

$ 19,865.00 

417 Aft Cabin Curtain (acoustic, track, magnets) 

$ 9,050.=0 

424 Credenza 

$ 14,975.00 

427 Aft 1/H Closet (new cabin) 

$ 22,340.00 

502 Aft R/H Galley 

$ 15,410.00 

503 Aft L/H Galley 

$ 21,090.00 

602 1/14 PSU / Valance Panel (mirror, hinged) 

$ 6,115.=0 

605 Aft Lavatory Vanity 

$ 13,860.00 

606 Potty Seat & Shroud (split, Cavity)<=> 

$ 5,490.=0 

611 Aft Lavatory R/H Closet (toilet paper)<=> 

$ 2,071.=0 

814 110 VAC Outlets (fwd crew galley) 

$ 3,761.=0 

815 Lighting System 

$ 6,740.=0 

6 

EFTA_R1_01891920 

EFTA02650912



829 Engineering / Certification / structural =& elect. 

$ 85,490.00 

options 

Bid Price 

$ 56,470.00 

Bid Price 

405 Inner Window Shades 

$ 38,640.00 

Bid Price 

$ 10,840.00 

Bid Price 

$ 27,610.00 
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Best Regards, 

Eric 

ERIC H. ROTH=span style="font-size:10.Optfont-family:"Aria)",sans-serif;col=r:#644e39"> I PRESIDENT 

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacAr=hur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com1 
Sent: Tuesday, April 25, 2017 10:34 AM 
To: Eric Roth 
Subject: Re: sn 

???? 

On Tue, Apr 25, 2017 at 10:07 AM Eric Rot 

Jeff, 

Do you know what the estimated cost is t= upgrade his Airshow 4000 to Revision 2? 
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What about the cost to direct wire an HD=I cable from Airshow to the TV so he has hi-def airshowh/=> 

If you need any specific info on the air=raft, let me know asap. 

Thank you! 

Best Regards, 

Eric 

ERIC H. ROTH=span style="font-size:10.0ptfont-family:"Arial",sans-serif;col=r:#644e39"> I PRESIDENT 

=U> 

2221 Sm=thtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779 

please not= 

The information contained in this communication is 

constitute inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized 
use, disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you 
have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 

9 

EFTA_R1_01891923 
EFTA02650915



jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

=nbsp; please note 

The information contained in this communica=ion is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitut= 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. 1= is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of th=s communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be=unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notif= us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeeva=ation@gmail.com> , and destro= this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. c=pyright -all rights reserved 
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