From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 2, 2017 2:43 PM
To: Larry Visoski; Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: STT Hanger from Shawn

300k "? how much handling did we pay last=two years?

On Tue, May 2, 2017 at 10:21 AM, Larry Visoski _ wrote:

Jeffrey
Received this text message from Shawn Miller in STT.,
Hanger G550 and Heli cost:

G550 521,016.90

Bell 430 $ 4,890.90
Monthly Total 525,907.80
Handling No Charge

Lav Mo Charge

Call Quts
5250 after 10pm

Note: Michael Hancock charges 5750 for handling / Lav 5100

Thx,
Larry

Sent from my iPad
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