From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Monday, April 24, 2017 1:07 PM
To: Erika Kellerhals
Subject: Re: USVI Legislation Project

what is the total owed? and to whom you =ill etc

<ekellerhals@kell=er.com <mailto:ekellerhals@kellfer.com> > wrote:

Rich - my assistant forgot to copy you. | am on a plane for the=next 90 minutes. Email me if you need anything.

Erika A. Kell=rhals
Member
Kellerhals Ferguson Kroblin PLLC

9053 Estate Thomas, Suite 101

Begin forwarded mess=ge:

From: "Gina Br=an" <gbrya=@kellfer.com <mailto:gbryan@kellfer.com> >
Date: April 24, 2017 at 8:42:43 AM EDT
==>To: <je=vacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= >

Cc: "'Erika Kellerhals' &=uot; <clemt=erhmefiotter-romr-ereitoeeeoettermteorittereom > >
Subject: USV| Legislation Project<=h>

Good Morning=

Attached are=the invoices for the USVI Legislation Project.

Please contact me with any questions.=/u>

EFTA_R1_01893144
EFTA02651385



Thank you.

Gina

==pan style="font-family:"Garamond" serif"> <=span>
gina m. bryan

office manager</=>

St.=Thomas, VI 00802

=C2¢

Motice: This communication may contain privi=eged or other confidential information. If you are not
the intended =ecipient, or believe that you have received this communication in error, p=ease do not print, copy, re-
transmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this i=formation. Also, please indicate to the sender that you have receive= this
e-mail in error, and delete the copy you received. Thank you.<=span>

Circular 230: To ensure complian=e with the requirements imposed by the IRS, we inform you that any
tax adv=ce contained in our communication (including any attachments) was not inte=ded or written to be used, and
cannot be used, for the purpose of (i) avoi=ing any tax penalty or (i) promoting, marketing or recommending to anothe=
party any transaction or matter addressed herein.</=pan>
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