
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, May 1, 2017 11:42 AM 
To: Ivjet 
Subject: Fwd: Single seat removal 

 Forwarded messag= 
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.co= <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
Date: Mon, May 1, 2017 at 7:42 AM 
Subject: Re: Singl= seat removal 
To: Eric Roth > 

hold off, until w= have a fabric. . I m going to fly the plane to eu=ope , and dont want trouble with ramp inspections. 
=. i would like you to measure the thickness of the seats=, yours vs my current and the width of the full berthed beds 

On Mon, M=y 1, 2017 at 7:34 AM, Eric Roth <eroth@intljet.com <mailto:er=th@intljet.com» wrote:<=r> 

Understood• RH#3 

Best regards, 

Eric 

Eric H. Roth, President 
International let Interiors 

www.intljet.com</=> <http://www.intljet.com> 

On May 1, 2017, at 7:32 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gm=il.com» wrote: 

seat behind mine 

On Mon, May 1, 2017 at 6:51 AM, Eric Roth » wrote: 

You pointed at removing the L/H #3 seat (just fwd of the divan). 

Just confirming that this is the seat you want removed= 

Best regards, 

Eric 

EFTA_R1_01893563 
EFTA02651495



Eric H. Roth, President 
International Jet Interiors 

• • 

. 

www.intljet.com</=> <http://www.intljet.com> 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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