
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2017 7:20 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: NY Project - Travelling Expenses 

Ok 

On Wed, Apr 19, 2017 at 3:15 PM =ichard Kahn <r  > 
wrote: 

please confirm ok to pay 29,299.25 euros for pint= travel expense 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Asso=iates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

<=r class="m_1941596915258727587Apple-interchange-newline"> 

<=iv>On Apr 19, 2017, at 5:55 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacati=n@gmail.com> 
> wrote: 

<=r class="m_1941596915258727587Apple-interchange-newline"> 

</=iv> 

 - Forwarded message 
From: Cabine= Alberto Pinto - Comptabilite <c >. 

><=r>Date: Wed, Apr 19, 2017 at 5:36 AM 
Subject: NY Project - Travelling E=penses 
To: j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Dear M. Epstei=, 

I hope this e-mail finds you well.<=u> 
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CABINET ALBERTO PINTO=/u> 

Emai 

Site internet : www.albertopinto.com <http://www.albertopinto.com/> 

11, rue dt=80,Aboukir 

Dear M. Epstein, 

<=span> 

=/span> 

Please find herewith our invoice concernin= the Travelling Expenses as of 20/03/2017 which amount to 
29,299.25 4=AC. 

We send you with it the statement whici details th=se expenses, and the relevant invoices. 

=C2* 

Please could you tell us when we will receive your bank=transfer of 29,299.25E ? 

Many thanks.=u> 

Best regards, 

Sandy Kahlert, 

Accounts Dep=rtment 

11, rue d'=boukir 

75002 Paris (France)=u> 

=div class="m_1941596915258727587gmail_signature" data-smartmail="gmail=signature"> 
please note 
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=div>The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, ma= be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and =s intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
=EE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or =ny part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have=received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately byreturn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communicatio= and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all righ=s reserved 

<NDD5 - TRAV=LLING EXPENSES NY 9E715 310317.pdf><TRANSPORT DEPLA=EMENT EPSTEIN NY 
200317.pdf><TRANSPORT AND TRAVELLI=G INVOICES.PDF> 

</=lockquote> 
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