From: eric roth <

Sent: Monday, April 24, 2017 9:36 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: RE:

I am just going through all the numbers to make sure they are tight and fair.

I suspect | will be done by 7:00pm.

As mentioned, | am putting my best foot forward on pricing. If you (or Richard) feel the need to negotiate, tell me what
dollar amount would satisfy that hunger and | will simply add it to the real number | will be providing - this would save
us all a lot of back and forth and wasted time.

Best Regards,

Eric

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT

» I | c I | N < oito:: I | vw.intjet.com

<http://www.intljet.com/> <http://twitter.com/#!/intljet> <http://www.facebook.com/intljet>

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, April 24, 2017 5:29 PM
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To: Eric Roth €_>

Subject:

did you forget us?

please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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