
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, April 21, 2017 4:39 PM 
To: Jeffre Epstein 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: 

do you know this invoice 

On Fri, Apr 21, 2017 at 11:52 AM, Jon Tom=inson < > wrote: 

I'm working on a =preadsheet to tie in the QB P&L to the schedule C and trying to sort o=t a couple 
discrepancies, which is why it's taking me a while. 

In response to their document request, I will also be sendi=g the attached A/R reports for the beginning and 
ending of 2014. 

On Apr 21, 2017, at 11:34 AM, jeffrey E.=<jeevacation=gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

Progress? 

=C24, please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constit=te inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies 

thereof, 
including all atta=hments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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=C24) please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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