
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2017 10:04 AM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 

enclosed is an invoice for the 8865 work, as p=r our diiscussion. . feel free to call me. . =C24r I also include in writing 
joslins ackowledgment in wriit=g this time to provent any " but he said " or =hey said - that the fees are deductible. -
as they have always =een.!! . 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Monday, April 17, 2017 6:22 PM 
To: Richard Joslin < 
Subject: Re: Re: 

so do we agree that a fee for filing the delinquenst 8865s and other docs. would be deductible. ?=C240 I think so . 
just checking with you. 

On Mon, Apr 17, 2017 at 6:24 PM, Richard Joslin < conversation-id 47074 date-last-viewed 0 date-received 14925O9867 
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