
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, April 13, 2017 1:01 AM 
To: Lvjet 
Subject: Re: Paint 

tell them 40k parts and or labor 

On Wed, Apr 12, 2017 at 4:28 PM, =vjet < <mailto > wrote: 

<=ont size="2" face="arial" color="black"> 
Jeffrey. 
ref Paint 
Savanah's offer is $274k plus a $20k parts or labor credit,. which=can be used off the price of the Paint,. $254k. 

must input by May 2nd., 
https://youtu.be/MlvalafqfN8 <https://youtu.be/MlvaKBTqfN8> paint shop SAV video., 

Midcoast in St Louis price is $218k (which is Gulfstream owned, l'=e seen their work,. its acceptable,. G550 serial 
5015 was painted in =t Louis per Eric Roth's recommendation. 

Falcon Jet Base $189k (not confirmed, from Eric)./ 

We painted the GIV in Jacksonville ,. for $140k,. we had to return to =ax to repaint Wing upper surface, due to 
Paint Mil thickness., 

the fuselage of the GIV has area of paint thickness beyond MIL t=ickness required by Gulfstream., 

Yes, we can paint for Less, could come with hidden issues like the GIV=/div> 

thx 
Larry 

=C24fr please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 

JEE 
Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

EFTA_R1_01897553 
EFTA02653701



commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e=mail to jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereo=, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

</=iv> 
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