
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, March 27, 2017 4:03 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: G550 update 

lee, I asked for 250k off, you offered 2=0k . would you like me to present it to my principal, =AO as a counter. ? be 
advised i received ap=roval last night for the 15 750. your call. 

On Mon, Mar 27, 201= at 11:27 AM, Larry Visoski <Ivjet@aol.com <mailtc > wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Lee just called me,. 
He informs that Chevron is prepared to give a price discount on the Purchas= price of $200k. 
His attorneys are standing by to adjust the contract to lower the purchase =rice to $15,800,000 If you approve,. 
Lee informs he would send his crew to Westfield tomorrow to arrive by 5pm t=en fly the G550 to Welmington Tuesday 
night, and be prepared to close Wedn=sday morning. 
If you approve Lea will have his attorneys draft the amended contract ASAP<=r> Thx Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 
href="mailtoleevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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