From: Richard Kahn IR

Sent: Wednesday, April 5, 2017 2:31 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: tee hee

please advise as DKl agreement states next payment is not due =ntil May 2017

4, =a) In consideration of the =ervices to be performed by the Consultant in accordance with the provisions of
this Agreement, the Foundation shall pay to the Consultant an aggregate =nnual fee of Twenty Five Thousand Dollars
(525,000.00) (the “Consulting =ee”) in accordance with the following payment schedule:

(i) two payments of Five Thousand Dollars (55,000.00) each, or a total of Ten =housand Dollars (510,000.00), have
been made to the Consultant prior to the Consultant’s execution of this Agreement, and the Consultant =cknowledges
receipt of the same: and

(i) a payment of Five Thousand Dollars (55,000.00) shall be made to the =onsultant on or before the first business
day of each of May, August and November, =017

Richard =ahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel = I

fax
cell

On Apr 5, 2017, at 10:28 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- =prwarded message ---------

From: paul krassner

Date: Wed, =pr 5, 2017 at 4:09 PM

Subject: tee hee

To: =effrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= =
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| haven't =eard from Rich so | hope you don’t mind that I'm just =eminding you that you never forget—pk

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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