From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Friday, March 24, 2017 2:37 PM
To: John Christensen; ann rodriquez
Subject: Re: Drone

Broken irrigating n line on scar hill

On Fri, Mar 24, 2017 at 10:36 AM John Christensen =It;_ = wrote:
Thank you, I'll bring mine next time but will use yours =or the shots they need right away
Sent from my iPhone
On Mar 24, 2017, at 10:27 AN, jeffre= E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto;jeevacation@gmail.com= > wrote;

<=iv class="gmail_msg">
or is mine a phantom 4 =A0 ? do as you please im okyou using mine

On Fri, Mar 24, 2017 at 10:17 AM, loh= Christensen _
>

Je=frey,

Phillipe and Kevin asked for various drone photos on G5J. Can | use yours o= should | send my
equipment over here?

| have a Phantom 4 so I'm used to operating them
Thanks
John

Sent from my iPhone

=AD please note

=pnfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

the use of the addressee. It is the property of
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this=br class="gmail_msg">communication or any part
thereof is strictly prohi=ited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this=br class="gmail_msg">communication in error, please
notify us immediatel= by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@g=ail.com, and

destroy this communication and all=copies thereof,

including all attachments. copyrigh= -all rights reserved

<=div>
=C2 please note

The information containe= in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the u=e of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disc=osure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly =rohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail =o

jeevacation@g=ail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
=ncluding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

</=iv
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