
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 1, 2017 3:00 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Mr. Bubbler Barge 

if you agree ok 

On Wed, Mar 1, 2017 at 9:54 AM, Richard Kahn < <mailto 
wrote: 

Should we request a release? Or something le=s formal? 

Richard Kahn =/div> 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

=div> 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ann Rodriquez < 
Date: March 1, =017 at 9:52:04 AM EST 
To: Rich Kahn < 
=c: jeevacat=on@gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gmail.com> 
Subject: Mr. Bubbler Barge 

=/blockquote> 

H=y Rich, 

> > 

> > 

Mr. Bubblers accountant Ms. Carme= called about his final payment. I explained to her that he's 
requesti=g an additional $15k for runs made between LSJ & GSJ. 

$15,000. 
I explained to Ms. Carmen our break down and explain to h=r why we only owe him $7,500 vs 
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<=lockquote type="cite"> 

=div> 

Please advise=payment, 
Ann R. 

4,=A0 please note 

The information contained in this=communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, mayconstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the=addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or=copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibite= 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in err=r, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com<=a>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including=all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

2 

EFTA_R1_01902876 
EFTA02656968


