
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Thursday, March 9, 2017 9:41 PM 

Re: 

Use tax owed and to be paid in April ? 

On Thu, Mar 9, 2017 at 5:35 PM < > wrote: 

=effrey-i will have john confirm but I am pretty confident you'll see 1=mm (of 28mm total due) federal taxes paid in 
calendar 2016; 16mm (of 17mm =otal due) NYS income taxes paid in calendar 2016 and 2.5mm of 2015 sales&a=p;use 
taxes paid in April 2016. This adds up to 36mm of cash taxes paid bu= does not include other state(s)' income tax. 
1=hn, will you confirm this for jeffrey. Thx, b Sent=from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

From: "Jeffrey E." &l=;jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
Date: Thu, 9 Mar =017 16:11:39 -0400 
To= Brad Wechsler < <mailto »; Barry J. 
Subject: 

can you get me a =ough idea of taxes paid last year. all in. fed ny =tate city sales. use etc. 

=AO please note 

=onfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 

the use of the addressee. It is the property of 

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this=br class="gmail_msg">communication or any part thereof is strictly 
prohi=ited and may be unlawful. If you have received this=br class="gmail_msg">communication in error, please notify 
us immediatel= by return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@g=ail.com, and destroy this communication and all=copies 
thereof, including all attachments. copyrigh= -all rights reserved 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constit=te 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addresse=. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying =f this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and =ay be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all atta=hments. copyright 
-all rights reserved 
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