
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

 Forwarded messag= 
From: ZM < 
Date: Tue, Mar 
Subject: Re: 
To: "jeffr=y E." <jeevacation@gmail.=om <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 

jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Tuesday, March 7, 2017 4:37 PM 
Richard Kahn 
Fwd: 

Have reached out to EB no res=onse 

RO - as mentioned Ser=ice on Membranes next week to relieve the high pressure issues on the Pump=and calibration 
pre and post treatment I will be on site for this Install HP Pump anticipate =id April Water Sof=ener - as in the past you 
should not require this, now that there is Calci=m Carbonate on site the water quality will improve Tech will be on site 
next week, will revie= entire system and forward our findings to you Regards Brice 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 7, 2017, at 8:43 AM, je=frey E. <jee=acation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

what happend after no bid recweived on feb 24th? =id anyone call them. . re r. o not sur= where we are , 
and water softber for master ?? 

pump 

On Tue, Mar 7, 2017 at 11:4= AM, Brice Gordon <z > wrote: 

=80 Jeffrey 

Switch Service had a 10 week lead time from signing of cont=act, approval was finally given Feb 1 
=O HP Pump replacement 8 to 10 lead time, renegotiated 4-6 weeks, with a sa=ings of 20K plus and a better 

Service is planned for next week. 

The main reason you have crappy w=ter is Smiley ran out of Calcium Carbonate, Did he ever come up to you 
and=say 

"Sir I need Calcium Carbonate= I have asked Danny and Anna to order and nothings happened" 
I assume not. 

Regarding the Metal Sheds 
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=div style="font-size:small">Received Drawings from John Woods Jan 7th 
Forwarded Drawings to Buck Steel for Bid =an 17th 
Revised bids from Buck Steel R=ceived Feb 1 
Forward to EB for Bid Feb=1, last communication Feb 16 they advising bids would be received Feb 23, =othing as 

of date. 
Forwarded to =rawings for Metal Sheds & Huts to Agencios Construction Feb 6th 
<=iv style="font-size:small"> 

If y=u wish I can forward all E Mails relating to these topics. 
I have forwarded proposals from Buck Steel and Agencio= to RK for his review 

regards Brice 
=br> 

On Tue, Mar 7, 2017 at 7:38 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.co=> wrote: 

= am aware . thnks howver it is march , 4 mon=hs later . and still nothing resolved. 

<=iv class="m259318985437525565m_2177976219496691723HOEnZb"> 

On Mon, Mar 6, 2017 at 10:22 PM, ZM > wrote:

Sorry 
I=worked extremely hard on all of these items. Especially RO and Switch Gear=/div> 
Noting Switch Gear issue star=ed in 2013 and RO in 2015 
I a=dressed these issues Nov 2016 after finding out that basically nothing was=working, no PMA 

being completed and everyone was blaming someone else for =he issues or ignoring it totally rather than trying to 
resolve them 

<=iv id="m_259318985437525565m_2177976219496691723m_6210506496330719585m_-
=581060716021366275AppleMailSignature"> 

I'm looking for long term resolve and relationships so th=s does not happen to you again 
Working extremely hard to save you expenses that companies where tr=ing to charge you. 

Doing all of this with very little support and working =emotely to resolve these issues 

will be fo=warding the Project Report noting all of this history, so you may review=C2 
Regards 
Brice 
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Sent from my iPhone 
=br>On Mar 6, 2017, at 6:11 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com» wrote: 

=/div> 

this is since dec? 

On Mon, Ma= 6, 2017 at 8:06 PM, ZM 
<mailtES > wrote: 

Jeffrey 

Expert builders have =een non responsive to request for bid package 
John Woods was working with the= ??!! 

I have=bids from another company which I received late last week 
The bid package includes=C2 
He=i pad GSJ 
Q Huts GSJ 
Metal buildings both RO and Engineering 
I have requested material labor an= more detail for scope of work to be forwarded. 

Anticipate end of the week=to have revised bids 

RO next week for service, depending on flight schedule, fl=ght cost and 5500.00 
Cash !!!! 
Genset Switch Gear service, Russelectric will be confirming t=morrow service schedule 

Duane and Vivian forward back ground release information =esterday 
Rich has this and past salary/income information 
If everything goes well Duan= could possibly start second week of April 
Once back ground is back and confi=med OK then we will sort out other details 

Housekeepers 
=pas informed via Una of situ=tion 
late Thursday last week 
She did try and reach out to other candidates but one did='t like the boats 
The other did not have the experience required 
Obviously t=is needs to be addressed 

GSJ Cottage IKEA Cabinets and Appliances have been order=d, estimated shipping 15 
March 

We would will finish and have ordered both furniture pac=ages before we leave 

GSJ cottage has been sent to you for your approval 
LS1 cottage will b= sent tonight for your approval 
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Personally 
We have almost finished basic pack of our house=/div> 
I have a=pointment with dentist Friday afternoon for two crowns that need to be 

rep=aced. 
Saturday or Sunday to ISJ, does that work for you ? 

Regards Brice 

Sent from my iPhone 
=div> 
On Mar 6, 2017, at 3:47 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailtoleeva=ation@gmail.com» wrote: 

waited for your =all. where are we on steel sheds . roof of r.o .=C2 . etc. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, =ay be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, an= is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property ofJEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication o= any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you ha=e received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by=br>return e-mail or by 

e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communicat=on and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all ri=hts reserved 

=AO please note 

The information=contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client=privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for=br>the use of the addressee. It is 

the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized =se, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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co=munication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or b= e-mail to jeev=cation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , 

and 
destroy this communication and all copies the=eof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Brice Gordon 
Stanley, NM 

=div>Ph: ( 

please note 

The inf=rmation contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorne=-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended =nly for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unaut=orized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part the=eof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received th=s 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-m=il or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all co=ies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reservedar> 

=C2 please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
</=iv> 
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