From: Churkin, Maxim W
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2017 5:45

To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re:

Thank you, Jeffrey. My mother and | will be taking him home today for the funeral. | will coordinate via Lesley once |
know when | will be back {about 2 weeks or so).

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 20, 2017, at 22:33, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

I'm in paris . We should talk when you are ready . You can count on me

On Tue, Feb 21, 2017 at 2:02 AM Churkin, Maxim <} G

Thank you. | appreciate it.

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >
Date: Monday, February 20, 2017 at 1:35 PM

Subject: <no subject>

sorry, you can count on me, to help in any way i can

please note
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=, and

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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