From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, February 20, 2017 6:30 PM
To: Kathy Ruemmler
Subject: Re: Sorry | missed you

im on [N

On Mon, Feb 20, 2017 at 6:02 PM, Kathy Rue=mier <[ [ [ |GGG < - - -

wrote:

Ok.

On F=b 20, 2017, at 11:59 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmai=.com= > wrote:

=blockquote type="cite">
They account for it differently

On Mon, Feb 20, 2017 at 5:12 PM Kathy Rue=mier <[ G

<mailto S > wrote:

=hy isn't the 250 furniture/decorating allowance the same as 250 cash i= their mind?

In other words, as it stands: | have said give me 5750k. They s=y, we will give you 5250k. You are saying
offer they give me $500k +=250k in decorating budget. Isn't that the equivalent of my offer=

=C2 please note

The information contained in this communic=tion is

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

constit=te inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addresse=. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies
thereof,

including all atta=hments. copyright -all rights reserved
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