
From: LSJ GSJ < 
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2017 5:49 PM 
To: jeffrir E. 
Subject: Re: 

Ok thank you 

Sent from my iPhon= 

On Feb 21, 2017, at 1:42 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

<=lockquote type="cite"> 
Back ad well 

On Tue, Feb 21, 2017 at 6:21 PM LSJ GSJ < <1=» wrote: 

> wrote: 

Based on our conversation wi=h had with you in Dec you had said that you where paying for 
) educational classes. I have received back up docs plus confirmed a= SIT office that you paid for 2014, but 

have paid for nothing since 
has continued with his classes, paying VI's a couple of small loans=br class="gmail_msg"> I just 

wish to confirm that you knew about this 
Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

<=iv class="m_-5597345519386768512gmail_signature gmail_msg" data-smartmail=3D"gmail_signature"> 
=nbsp; please note 

The=information contained in this communication is 
confi=ential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
const=tute inside information, and is intended only for 
th= use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gmai=.com> , and<=r 

class="gmail_msg">destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserv=d 
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<1=iv> 
&nb=p; please note 

The information contained in=this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, m=y constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of t=e addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure o= copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibite= and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in erro=, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d destroy this communication and all copies thereof, induding all at=achments. copyright -all 
rights reserved 
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