
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2017 6:35 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: 8727 parts 

delay 

On Tue, Feb 21, 2017 at 7:28 PM, Larry Visoski < > wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Gary Anzalone has a buyer for the interior of the 8727„ 
$50k net to you„ Gary said he will request additional money for his commis=ion from Buyer„ 

Scott Stambaugh informs; Nygard is due his "C" check in June„ 

Don't sell the interior just yet„I'm doing an A check on Nygard an= he has a bad engine mount yoke on his 
aircraft. Was already told by=B.F. Goodrich that there is none available. 

his Boeing has corrosion and he already knows it's close to: BER 
(Beyond economical repair)„ 

Should we wait to see if Nygart is ready to buy your 727 in June? 

Pls advise? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

Sent from my iPhone 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
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received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 
href="mailtoieevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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