From: Larry Visoski

Sent: Thursday, May 24, 2018 5:27 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: Airshow APP upgrade
Jeffrey

I'll confirm thes= numbers with leff Shaw, Eric’s Avionics installer based in New Ham=shire ,, this was his estimate back
in June 2017,, For airshow ap= was 522,605 Thx Larry

=80 ———-

Here are the numbers:
AiR Show App = 522,605

&nbs=; T=e Shades control at the VIP seat requires a new switch panel which will nee= plating and installation
from Eric's guys.

We will also have 512K roughly in travel if we do either t=e Wifi control and or the Shades. Probably half of that for the
AS app if d=ne by itself.

&=bsp,
<f=>

Best regards,</=>

Jeffrey Shaw

Londonderry, NH 03053 <x-apple-data-detectors://4/1>

Sent from my iPhone

On Ma= 24, 2018, at 1:05 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.c=m:> > wrote:

try another electonics shop
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On Thu, May 24, 2018 at 12:40 PM Larry Vi=oski S5 NG - ot

<=div>

Jeffrey

Attached is the quote we received from Rusty last year when we asked about A=rshow to IPad App
1-Airshow Displayed on IPAD 528k

2- replace Pronto Remote, utilizing IPAD control 579k

See attached

I'll call Rusty and confirm if there are other options

Thx
Larryv

Sent from my iPhone

please note

The inf=rmation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney=client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended on=y for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthor=zed use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof=is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this

return e-mail or=by e-mail to jee=acation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=, and
destroy this communication and all copies the=eof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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