
From: Kathy Ruemmler 
Sent: Wednesday, February 8, 2017 10:06 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

Yes sir! 

On Feb 8, 2017, at 4:58 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

do NOT tell greg anything. . there is a 400k commision here that has to come down. 

On Wed, Feb 8, 2017 at 5:53 PM, Kathy Ruemmler 

wrote:

Greg said broker just called and said "we can make this work if we meet in the middle". 7,250,000 

please note 
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