From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 7, 2017 6:34 PM

Subject: Re:

ok will put down deposit but it needs to be cl=ar that if we do not find someone it is returned.

They said | can visit the school but there is no students at this mome=t,they should recall them to come to the
school so they need your sign to =ake sure we are serious about this...

Le 8 féyr. 2017 & 00:17, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevaca=ion@gmail.com> > a écri= ;

dont understand

On Tue, Feb 7, 2017 at 11:08 AM, __<mailt::|— wrote:

Dear Jeff | need your sign for this authorization,you need pay around 3,500= for the commission
of the school if you agreellet me know.

Kiss

please note

The information contained in this communication is

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= , and

1

EFTA_R1_01910282
EFTA02661694



destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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